RFP #1745
KENT SI-ATE EL‘:::“,:T Janitorial Chemicals Supplies

Issued: February 17,2021

RFP 1745 Pricing Summary/Scores SREFL
Chore
Vendor Core Chemicals| Chemicals Hand & Body H.a!'d Paper Liners Misc Supplies Grand Total
Soap Sanitizers
Adjusted

$153,085.23 $108,628.28 41,504.00 23,861.96 145,372.97 | $  98,386.64 76,330.24 $494,084.10
$54,867.86 $49,049.20 72,436.95 34,790.00 209,050.01 [ $§ 125,914.58 97,561.11 $588,801.84

$203,477.33 $139,494.46 72,436.95 34,790.00 209,050.01 | $§ 125,914.58 97,561.11 $679,247.11
$53,720.98 $100,887.81 57,799.99 24,204.89 115,630.52 [ $  85,035.83 81,267.03 $464,826.07
$47,932.56 $144,362.11 | $ 57,799.99 | $ 24,204.89 | $115,630.52 | $§  85,035.83 | $ 81,267.03 $508,300.37.

$143,462.27 $121,668.99 | $ 40,477.16 | $ 23,861.96 | $106,036.66 | $ 124,071.73 | $ 75,204.86 $491,321.36

$178,555.61 $209,227.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$69,376.65 | $288,140.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$142,553.52 | $141,470.72 | $ 39,607.90 | $ 22,776.22 | $140,044.76 78,460.66
$198,733.21 | $321,587.00 | $ 39,607.90 | $ 22,776.22 | $140,044.76 78,460.66

90,323.82 | $512,684.07
90,323.82 | $692,800.35

$ $ $
$ S $
$123,539.75 | $108,930.16 | $ 58,682.65 | $ 21,234.66 | $285,048.07 [ $§  95,630.61 | $ 89,482.53
$145219.61 | $146,493.45 | $ 58,682.65 | $ 21,234.66 | $285,048.07 [ $  95,630.61 | $ 89,482.53
(Vendor names redacted.) $112,323.49 | $104,857.17 | $ 63,229.45 | § 22,241.74 | $303,002.22 | § 184,783.63 | $ 8557335 | $763,687.56
$17,707.65 | $964,333.18 | $ 63,220.45 | $ 22,241.74 | $303,002.22 | $ 18478363 | § 85,573.35 | $1,623,163.57
$135047.53 |  $95,190.18 | $ 42,211.59 [ § 24,580.44 | $116,081.44 [ $§  99,430.10 | $ 97,987.84 | $475481.59
$125844.21 | $215730.39 | $ 42,211.59 | § 24,580.44 | $116,081.44 [ $§  99,430.10 | $ 97,987.84 | $596,021.80
$90,780.77 | $91,417.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$95,166.02 | $96,621.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$150,176.19 |  $90,569.47 | $ 41,257.11 | § 23,411.23 [ $132,697.41 [ $  77,581.67 | $ 87,512.42 | $453,019.32
$136,708.66 |  $81,666.14 | $ 41,257.11 | § 23,411.23 | $132,697.41 [ $  77,581.67 | $ 87,512.42 | $444,125.99

$174,527.87 | $243,422.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $141,607.68 | $ 115,657.79 $ 257,65.47
$ 142,289.89 | $ 83,419.58 | $ 41,257.11 | $ 2341123 | $132,697.41|$ 77,581.67 [ § 87,512.42 | $445879.43
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid [$ -

PricingScore | Paper & Liners| Pricing Score | Misc Supplies| Pricing Score

vendor Chemicals 11| ¢y Matrix 12:35 for Matrix 36-191 for Matrix GrandTotal

$173,994.24 $ 243,759.62 $ 76,330.24 $  494,084.10

$156,276.15 5 $ 334,964.59 2 $ 97,561.11 2 $  588,80184

$246,721.41 2 $ 334,964.59 $ 97,561.11 $  679.247.11

$182,892.69 4 $ 200,666.35 5 $ 81,267.03 5 $  464,826.07

$226,366.99 2 $ 200,666.35 $ 81,267.03 $ _ 508,300.37

$186,008.11 4 $ 230,108.38 3 $ 75,204.86 5 $  491,321.36

$203,854.84 3 $ 218,505.42 4 $ 90323.82 3 $  512,684.07

$383971.12 1 $ 218,505.42 $ 90,323.82 $  692,800.35

$188,847.47 3 $ 380,678.68 2 $ 8948253 3 $  659,008.68

(Vendor names redacted.) $226,410.76 2 $ 380,678.68 $ 89,482.53 $ 69657197
$190,328.36 3 $ 487,785.85 1 $ 85,573.35 4 $ _763,687.56

$1,049,804.37 1 $ 487,785.85 $ 85573.35 $ 1,623,163.57

$161,982.20 4 $ 21551155 4 $ 97,987.84 2 $ 47548159

$282,522.41 1 $ 215,511.55 $ 97.987.84 $  596,021.80

$155,227.82 5 $210,279.08 5 $ 87,512.42 4 $ 45301932

$146,334.48 5 $210,079.08 $ 87,512.42 $ 44412599

$ 257,265.47 3




